BID #:
BID NAME:
OPENED:

122010
Aggregate for Surface Treatment
February 4, 2022

CTH A (USH 51 to East Co. Line)

[ |-to befilled by Dane County

$ 1.00

/ton Stockpile

0.28 Hauling/ton/mile

PPTION "A" - DELIVERED TO DESIGNATED LOCATION WITHIN BI

PPTION "B" - COUNTY PICKUP - SUPPLIERS STOCKPIL|

ey R e ecatien LEUSEL oo $/Ton Material | Miles | Hauling | Stockpile Total $/Ton Material Miles Hauling Total
Rosenbaum 971 State Road 138 Stoughtor Pea Gravel 840 12.40 10,416.0 | 9.40 | 2,210.88 840.0 13,466.88 9.00 7,560.0 10.50 2,469.6 10,029.6
Michels Waterloo/Hubbleton Rd Waterloo & Holders/Taylor Rd Ric |Pea Gravel 840 22.00 18,480.0 | 9.40 | 2,210.88 840.0 21,530.88 14.50 12,180.0 24.20 5,691.8 17,871.8
Michels Waterloo/Hubbleton Rd Waterloo & Holders/Taylor Rd Ric | Quartzite 700 28.00 19,600.0 | 9.40 | 1,842.40 700.0 22,142.40 19.00 13,300.0 24.20 4,743.2 18,043.2
Wingra Stone Kampeier Quarry/ 4381 Marsh Road McFarlanc Pea Gravel 840 15.15 12,726.0 | 9.40 2,210.88 840.0 15,776.88 12.00 10,080.0 19.20 4,515.8 14,595.8
CTH BN (USH 12 to CTH B) $  1.00 /ton Stockpile 0.28 Haulingfton/mile
Vendor Pit Name/Location Material Ton PPTION "A" - DELIVERED TO DESIGNATED LOCATION WITHIN BI PPTION "B" - COUNTY PICKUP - SUPPLIERS STOCKPIL|
$/Ton Material | Miles | Hauling | Stockpile Total $/Ton Material Miles Hauling Total
Rosenbaum 971 State Road 138 Stoughtor Pea Gravel| 1,030 12.40 12,772.0| 6.10 | 1,759.24 1030.0 15,561.24 9.00 9,270.0 10.30 2,970.5 12,240.5
Michels Waterloo/Hubbleton Rd Waterloo & Holders/Taylor Rd Ric |Pea Gravel| 1,030 22.00 22,660.0 | 6.10 | 1,759.24 1030.0 25,449.24 14.50 14,935.0 23.10 6,662.0 21,597.0
Michels Waterloo/Hubbleton Rd Waterloo & Holders/Taylor Rd Ric | Quartzite 870 28.00 24,360.0 | 6.10 | 1,485.96 870.0 26,715.96 19.00 16,530.0 23.10 5,627.2 22,157.2
Wingra Stone Kampeier Quarry/ 4381 Marsh Road McFarlanc Pea Gravel| 1,030 15.15 15,604.5 | 6.10 1,759.24 1030.0 18,393.74 12.00 12,360.0 11.20 3,230.1 15,590.1
CTH H (STH 78 south end to STH 78 north end) $  1.00 /ton Stockpile 0.28 Hauling/ton/mile
Vendor Pit Name/Location Material Ton PPTION "A" - DELIVERED TO DESIGNATED LOCATION WITHIN BI PPTION "B" - COUNTY PICKUP - SUPPLIERS STOCKPIL|
$/Ton Material | Miles | Hauling | Stockpile Total $/Ton Material Miles Hauling Total
Rosenbaum Rosenbaum Pit/971 State Road 138 Stoughtor Pea Gravel 840 17.25 14,490.0 | 4.00 940.80 840.0 16,270.80 No bid 0.0 0.0 0.0
Michels Waterloo/Hubbleton Rd Waterloo & Holders/Taylor Rd Ric |Pea Gravel 840 27.00 22,680.0 | 4.00 940.80 840.0 24,460.80 14.50 12,180.0 58.90 | 13,853.3 26,033.3
Michels Waterloo/Hubbleton Rd Waterloo & Holders/Taylor Rd Ric | Quartzite 700 29.50 20,650.0 | 4.00 784.00 700.0 22,134.00 19.00 13,300.0 58.90 | 11,5444 24,844.4
Wingra Stone Kampeier Quarry/ 4381 Marsh Road McFarlanc Pea Gravel 840 No bid - 0.00 0.0 0.00 No bid 0.0 0.0 0.0
CTH M (Valley View to CTH S) $ 1.00 /ton Stockpile 0.28 Hauling/ton/mile
Vendor Pit Name/Location Material Ton PPTION "A" - DELIVERED TO DESIGNATED LOCATION WITHIN BI PPTION "B" - COUNTY PICKUP - SUPPLIERS STOCKPIL|
$/Ton Material | Miles | Hauling | Stockpile Total $/Ton Material Miles Hauling Total
Rosenbaum Rosenbaum Pit/971 State Road 138 Stoughtor Pea Gravel 400 14.70 5,880.0 | 7.30 817.60 400.0 7,097.60 No bid 0.0 0.0 0.0
Michels Waterloo/Hubbleton Rd Waterloo & Holders/Taylor Rd Ric |Pea Gravel 400 21.50 8,600.0 | 7.30 817.60 400.0 9,817.60 14.50 5,800.0 39.40 4,412.8 10,212.8
Michels Waterloo/Hubbleton Rd Waterloo & Holders/Taylor Rd Ric | Quartzite 340 27.75 9,435.0 | 7.30 694.96 340.0 10,469.96 19.00 6,460.0 39.40 3,750.9 10,210.9
Wingra Stone Kampeier Quarry/ 4381 Marsh Road McFarlanc Pea Gravel 400 15.00 6,000.0 | 7.30 817.60 400.0 7,217.60 12.00 4,800.0 13.80 1,545.6 6,345.6
CTH N (Dunkirk to USH 31 north of CTH A) $  1.00 /ton Stockpile 0.28 Haulingfton/mile
A n . PPTION "A" - DELIVERED TO DESIGNATED LOCATION WITHIN BI PPTION "B" - COUNTY PICKUP - SUPPLIERS STOCKPIL|
ey R e ecatien LEUSEL oo $/Ton Material | Miles | Hauling | Stockpile Total $/Ton Material Miles Hauling Total
Rosenbaum Rosenbaum Pit/971 State Road 138 Stoughtor Pea Gravel 190 12.40 2,356.0 | 2.00 106.40 190.0 2,652.40 9.00 1,710.0 2.80 149.0 1,859.0
Michels Waterloo/Hubbleton Rd Waterloo & Holders/Taylor Rd Ric |Pea Gravel 190 22.00 4,180.0 | 2.00 106.40 190.0 4,476.40 14.50 2,755.0 30.80 1,638.6 4,393.6
Michels Waterloo/Hubbleton Rd Waterloo & Holders/Taylor Rd Ric | Quartzite 160 28.00 4,480.0 | 2.00 89.60 160.0 4,729.60 19.00 3,040.0 30.80 1,379.8 4,419.8
Wingra Stone Kampeier Quarry/ 4381 Marsh Road McFarlanc Pea Gravel 190 15.15 2,878.5 | 2.00 106.40 190.0 3,174.90 12.00 2,280.0 13.10 696.9 2,976.9
CTH N ( CTH B to USH 12/18) $ 1.00 /ton Stockpile 0.28  Hauling/ton/mile
A n . PPTION "A" - DELIVERED TO DESIGNATED LOCATION WITHIN BI PPTION "B" - COUNTY PICKUP - SUPPLIERS STOCKPIL|
ey R e ecatien LEUSEL oo $/Ton Material | Miles | Hauling | Stockpile Total $/Ton Material Miles Hauling Total
Rosenbaum Rosenbaum Pit/971 State Road 138 Stoughtor Pea Gravel| 1,110 12.40 13,764.0 | 440 | 1,367.52 1110.0 16,241.52 9.00 9,990.0 8.60 2,672.9 12,662.9
Michels Waterloo/Hubbleton Rd Waterloo & Holders/Taylor Rd Ric |Pea Gravel| 1,110 22.00 24,420.0 | 4.40 | 1,367.52 1110.0 26,897.52 14.50 16,095.0 25.40 7,894.3 23,989.3
Michels Waterloo/Hubbleton Rd Waterloo & Holders/Taylor Rd Ric | Quartzite 930 28.00 26,040.0 | 4.40 | 1,145.76 930.0 28,115.76 19.00 17,670.0 25.40 6,614.2 24,284.2
Wingra Stone Kampeier Quarry/ 4381 Marsh Road McFarlanc Pea Gravel| 1,110 15.15 16,816.5 | 4.40 1,367.52 1110.0 19,294.02 12.00 13,320.0 8.20 2,548.6 15,868.6
CTH P (CTH S to USH 14) $  1.00 /ton Stockpile 0.28 Haulingfton/mile
A n . PPTION "A" - DELIVERED TO DESIGNATED LOCATION WITHIN BI PPTION "B" - COUNTY PICKUP - SUPPLIERS STOCKPIL|
ey R e ocatien LS oo $/Ton Material | Miles | Hauling | Stockpile Total $/Ton Material Miles Hauling Total
Rosenbaum Rosenbaum Pit/971 State Road 138 Stoughtor Pea Gravel 910 17.25 15,697.5 | 9.40 2,395.12 910.0 19,002.62 No bid 0.0 0.0 0.0
Michels Waterloo/Hubbleton Rd Waterloo & Holders/Taylor Rd Ric |Pea Gravel 910 23.25 21,157.5| 9.40 | 2,395.12 910.0 24,462.62 14.50 13,195.0 49.80 | 12,689.0 25,884.0
Michels Waterloo/Hubbleton Rd Waterloo & Holders/Taylor Rd Ric | Quartzite 760 28.25 21,470.0 | 9.40 | 2,000.32 760.0 24,230.32 19.00 14,440.0 49.80 | 10,597.4 25,037.4
Wingra Stone Kampeier Quarry/ 4381 Marsh Road McFarlanc Pea Gravel 910 No bid - 0.00 0.0 0.00 No Bid 0.0 0.0 0.0
CTHT (CTH TT - Ridge to Marshall) $  1.00 /ton Stockpile 0.28 Haulingfton/mile
A n . PPTION "A" - DELIVERED TO DESIGNATED LOCATION WITHIN BI PPTION "B" - COUNTY PICKUP - SUPPLIERS STOCKPIL|
ey R e ecatien LS oo $/Ton Material | Miles | Hauling | Stockpile Total $/Ton Material Miles Hauling Total
Rosenbaum Rosenbaum Pit/971 State Road 138 Stoughtor Pea Gravel 700 15.15 10,605.0 | 10.90 | 2,136.40 700.0 13,441.40 No bid 0.0 0.0 0.0
Michels Waterloo/Hubbleton Rd Waterloo & Holders/Taylor Rd Ric |Pea Gravel 700 22.25 15,575.0 | 10.90 | 2,136.40 700.0 18,411.40 14.50 10,150.0 9.30 1,822.8 11,972.8
Michels Waterloo/Hubbleton Rd Waterloo & Holders/Taylor Rd Ric | Quartzite 590 25.25 14,897.5| 10.90 | 1,800.68 590.0 17,288.18 19.00 11,210.0 9.30 1,536.4 12,746.4
Wingra Stone Kampeier Quarry/ 4381 Marsh Road McFarlanc Pea Gravel 700 15.15 10,605.0 | 10.90 | 2,136.40 700.0 13,441.40 12.00 8,400.0 18.20 3,567.2 11,967.2

CTHTT (CTH

Nto CTHT)
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0.28 Hauling/ton/mile



BID #: 122010
BID NAME: Aggregate for Surface Treatment
OPENED: February 4, 2022

[ |-to befilled by Dane County

A n o PPTION "A" - DELIVERED TO DESIGNATED LOCATION WITHIN BI PPTION "B" - COUNTY PICKUP - SUPPLIERS STOCKPIL|
ey R e ecatien LS oo $/Ton Material | Miles | Hauling | Stockpile Total $/Ton Material Miles Hauling Total
Rosenbaum Rosenbaum Pit/971 State Road 138 Stoughtor Pea Gravel| 1,120 15.15 16,968.0 | 7.10 2,226.56 1120.0 20,314.56 No bid 0.0 0.0 0.0
Michels Waterloo/Hubbleton Rd Waterloo & Holders/Taylor Rd Ric |Pea Gravel| 1,120 22.25 24,920.0 | 7.10 | 2,226.56 1120.0 28,266.56 14.50 16,240.0 14.30 4,484.5 20,724.5
Michels Waterloo/Hubbleton Rd Waterloo & Holders/Taylor Rd Ric | Quartzite 940 25.25 23,735.0| 7.10 | 1,868.72 940.0 26,543.72 19.00 17,860.0 14.30 3,763.8 21,623.8
Wingra Stone Kampeier Quarry/ 4381 Marsh Road McFarlanc Pea Gravel| 1,120 No bid - 0.00 0.0 0.00 No Bid 0.0 0.0 0.0
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