Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
608-266-4966
www.danepurchasing.com

BID SUMMARY

BID #: 122018
Native Seeds
1/18/2022

Vendor Name:

Agrecol

Environmental Seeds West, DBA
Granite Seed & Erosion Control

Shooting Star Native Seeds

Local Vendor Preference

Locally Based & Owned Vendor

No Preference

Locally Operated Vendor

Local Content Preference

Wisconsin-Made

No Preference

No Preference

Cooperative Purchasing Yes Yes Yes
Qf]ift'zzgp'l’; WS;EYL(JSES Availability Date| Alt Spec Qf]i):t'ts’z;p'{; Cv(\)/setilguhrlIt Availability Date| Alt Spec g‘i’:t'zzgp'g, Cv(\)/s;etilguhrlIt Availability Date| Alt Spec

COMMON NAME - Grasses and Sedges LB) (PLSLB) (PLSLB)
American Beak Grass No Bid
Awl-Fruited Sedge 1.00 $250.00
Bebb's Oval Sedge 2.00 $ 320.00 2.00 $160.00
Big Bluestem 11.00 $17.00 $10.00
Blue Joint Grass 1.00 $350.00 $900.00
Bottlebrush Grass $ 100.00 $75.00
Bristly Sedge 2.00 $ 240.00
Broad-Leaved Woolly Sedge 2.00 $225.00
Brown Fox Sedge 2.00 $80.00 $60.00
Canada Rush No Bid
Canada Wild Rye 25.00 $ 14.00 $15.00 $8.00
Common Lake Sedge No Bid
Common Rush 5.00 $ 500.00 1.00 $400.00 $200.00
Common Tussock Sedge $800.00
Cord Grass No Bid
Crested Oval Sedge No Bid
Curly-Styled Wood Sedge No Bid
Dark-Green Bulrush $ 100.00 $60.00
Dudley's Rush 5.00 $ 650.00 $480.00
Ear-Leaved Brome No Bid
Fowl Manna Grass 25.00 $150.00 $180.00
Fringed Brome $25.00
Great Bulrush 1.00 $ 160.00 10.00 $200.00 $120.00
Great Bur Reed 25.00 $250.00 $60.00
Hairy-Fruited Lake Sedge No Bid
Indian Grass $ 18.00 $20.00 $12.00
June Grass No Bid
Knotted Rush No Bid
Lance-Fruited Oval Sedge $180.00
Little Bluestem $28.00 $12.00
Long-Awned Bracted Sedge No Bid
Long-Beaked Sedge 10.00 $ 320.00
Marsh Muhly No Bid
Narrow-Leaved Oval Sedge No Bid
Pennsylvania Sedge No Bid
Plains Oval Sedge $ 120.00 $120.00




Porcupine Grass 3.00 $ 200.00 $180.00
Porcupine Sedge $ 160.00 $120.00
Poverty Oat Grass No Bid
Prairie Brome No Bid
Prairie Dropseed 8.00 $ 300.00 1.00 $220.00
Reed Mana Grass 4.00 $ 200.00 10.00 $150.00 $120.00
Rice Cut Grass $120.00
River Bulrush No Bid
River Oats No Bid
Scribner's Panic Grass No Bid
Short-Headed Bracted Sedge No Bid
Sideoats Grama $18.00 $12.00
Silky Wild Rye $60.00
Switchgrass $ 10.00 $15.00
Virginia Wild Rye 50.00 $15.00
Wool Grass 5.00 $ 140.00 $100.00
Totals:
52 species
Max ozs if in Cpst/Unit o Max ozs if in COSt./U”it o Max ozs if in COSt./U”it o
short supply Weight (PLS |Availability Date| Alt Spec short supply Weight |Availability Date| Alt Spec short supply Weight |Availability Date| Alt Spec
COMMON NAME - Forbs LB) (PLS LB) (PLS LB)
Angelica $ 160.00 $100.00
Anise Hyssop No Bid
Aromatic Aster No Bid
Arrow-Leaved Aster No Bid
Bellwort No Bid
Biennial Gaura No Bid
Bird's Foot Violet No Bid
Black Cohosh No Bid
Black-Eyed Susan 80.00 $45.00 $50.00
Bloodroot No Bid
Blue Cohosh No Bid
Blue Vervain 32.00 $150.00 $120.00
Boneset $720.00
Bottle Gentian No Bid
Brown-Eyed Susan 80.00 $ 200.00 $60.00
Butterfly Milkweed 16.00 $350.00 $300.00
Button Blazing Star $650.00
Canada Anemone $ 450.00 $ 450.00
Canada Milk Vetch 320.00 $150.00 $30.00
Cardinal Flower 32.00 $ 1,000.00 $800.00
Columbine $600.00
Common Arrowhead $350.00
Common Beggarticks $ 240.00 $240.00
Common Carrion Flower No Bid
Common Evening Primrose | | | 8.00 I $100.00 |
Common Ironweed No Bid
Common Mikweed [s  160.00] | 32000 [ s300.00 | $90.00
Compass Plant No Bid
Cow Parsnip | | | | | $40.00




Cowbane No Bid

Cream Gentian $400.00
Cream Wild Indigo No Bid

Culver's Root $ 800.00

Cup Plant $ 160.00 $120.00
Ditch Stonecrop 8.00 $ 160.00

Dogbane No Bid

Doll's Eyes No Bid

Dotted St. John’s Wort No Bid

Downy Gentian No Bid

Downy Painted Cup No Bid

Downy Wood Mint No Bid

Drummond’s Aster No Bid

Dutchman's Breeches No Bid

Early Figwort No Bid

Early Meadow Rue $600.00
Early Sunflower 48.00 $90.00

Early Wild Rose $300.00
Elm-Leaved Goldenrod No Bid

False Boneset No Bid

Flat-Topped Aster | | | $700.00
Flowering Spurge No Bid

Foxglove Beardtongue [s 20000 | | $120.00
Fringed Loosestrife No Bid

Frost Aster | | | $300.00
Germander No Bid

Glad Mallow |'s 80.00 | |

Goat's Rue No Bid

Golden Alexanders | $ 200.00 | | $60.00
Golden Ragwort No Bid

Grass Of Parnassus No Bid

Grass-Leaved Goldenrod No Bid

Great Blue Lobelia $600.00
Great St. John’s Wort $ 160.00 $120.00
Great Water Dock No Bid

Grooved Yellow Flax No Bid

Hairy Golden Aster 640.00 $350.00

Hairy Wood Mint 16.00 $  1,200.00

Harebell No Bid

Heart-Leaved Aster No Bid

Heart-Leaf Golden Alexanders No Bid

Heath Aster No Bid

Hoary Vervain No Bid

Honewort No Bid

llinois Tick Trefoil $15.00 $300.00
Indian Tobacco No Bid

Jack-in-the-Pulpit No Bid

Jacob’s Ladder No Bid

Joe Pye Weed $350.00




Lance-Leaf Coresopsis 800.00 $50.00

Large-Flowered Beardtongue 80.00 $200.00

Late Figwort $400.00
Late Goldenrod No Bid

Late Horse Gentian No Bid

Lead Plant No Bid

Lion’s Foot No Bid

Lopseed No Bid

Marbleseed No Bid

Marsh Betony No Bid

Marsh Marigold $1,000.00
Marsh Vetchling No Bid

Meadow Blazing Star No Bid

Meadowsweet No Bid

Michigan Lily No Bid

Midland Shooting Star $1,500.00
Missouri Goldenrod No Bid

Monkey Flower $200.00
Mountain Mint $600.00
New England Aster 32.00 $1,000.00 $320.00
New Jersey Tea No Bid

Nodding Onion $180.00
Northern Blue Flag No Bid

Northern Bedstraw No Bid

Northern Blue Flag No Bid

Obedient Plant No Bid

Ohio Spiderwort $300.00
Old Field Goldenrod No Bid

Pale Purple Coneflower No Bid

Pale Spiked Lobelia No Bid

Partridge Pea 320.00 $ 20.00 $40.00 $8.00
Pasque Flower No Bid

Pasture Thistle No Bid

Pearly Everlasting No Bid

Pointed-Leaved Tick Trefoil No Bid

Poke Milkweed No Bid

Prairie Alumroot No Bid

Prairie Blazing Star 8000 |$ 32000 3312022 | [ [ | $200.00 |
Prairie Blue-Eyed Grass No Bid

Prairie Cinquefoil [s 20000 ] | | | | $150.00 |
Prairie Coreopsis No Bid

Prairie Dock 8000 |s  40000] 3312022 | | | | $275.00 |
Prairie Indian Plantain No Bid

Prairie Lily No Bid

Prairie Loosestrife No Bid

Prairie Phlox No Bid

Prairie Sage No Bid

Prairie Smoke No Bid

Prairie Violet No Bid




Prairie Wild Rose

$240.00

Purple Giant Hyssop 16.00 $ 320.00 $400.00
Purple Meadow Rue $200.00
Purple Milkweed No Bid
Purple Prairie Clover | | | $45.00 | $30.00
Pussytoes No Bid
Rattlesnake Master | | | | $150.00
Red Baneberry No Bid
Riddell's Goldenrod No Bid
Rose Milkweed 16.00 $500.00 $150.00
Rosin Weed $200.00
Round-Headed Bush Clover No Bid
Royal Catchfly No Bid
Sand Evening Primrose No Bid
Saw-Tooth Sunflower $450.00
Shining Aster No Bid
Showy Goldenrod No Bid
Showy Sunflower No Bid
Showy Tick Trefoil $60.00
Silky Aster No Bid
Sky Blue Aster No Bid
Small Skullcap No Bid
Smooth Blue Aster 16.00 $450.00 $250.00
Smooth Hedgenettle No Bid
Sneezeweed No Bid
Solomon’s Plume No Bid
Solomon’s Seal [ [ | | $300.00
Spikenard No Bid
Spotted Bee Balm 1600 s 800.00 | | | $450.00
Starry Campion No Bid
Starry Solomon’s Plume No Bid
Stiff Aster No Bid
Stiff Gentian No Bid
Stiff Goldenrod $ 200.00 $120.00
Swamp Rose No Bid
Swamp Saxifrage No Bid
Swamp Thistle No Bid
Sweet Black-Eyed Susan $ 144.00 $120.00
Sweet Cicely $500.00
Sweet Indian Plantain No Bid
Sweet Joe Pye Weed No Bid
Tall Belflower 1600 |$  800.00 | | | $800.00
Tall Boneset No Bid
Tall Coreopsis No Bid
Tall Thimbleweed | | | | $600.00
Thimbleweed No Bid
Tufted Loosestrife No Bid
Turtlehead No Bid
Veiny Pea No Bid




Violet Wood Sorrel

Virgin’s Bower

Virginia Bluebells

Virginia Waterleaf

Water Horehound

Western Sunflower
White Prairie Clover

160.00

$120.00

White Wild Indigo
Whorled Milkweed
Wild Bergamot
Wild Blue Phlox
Wild Geranium
Wild Ginger

Wild Golden Glow

$

240.00

32.00 $300.00

$180.00

$150.00

$300.00

Wild Leek

16.00

$

800.00

Wild Lupine

Wild Mint

Wild Petunia

Wild Quinine

Wild Senna

Wild Strawberry
Wild Yam

Wood Betony
Woodland Knotweed
Woundwort

Yellow Coneflower

Yellow False Foxglove

Yellow Giant Hyssop

Yellow Pimpernel

Zig Zag Goldenrod
Totals:

206 species
Lowest Bid

800.00 $50.00

32.00 $200.00

$60.00

$750.00



	All Vendors

